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Registration is OPEN: Click HERE for more details!

Registration is OPEN: Click HERE for more details!

Click HERE to Register Virtual
Click HERE for In-Person

Click HERE to Register

Click the Dates Below to Register:
May 9    May 17    May 23    May 31    June 7

Click HERE to Register

          Click the links below to register

4/20        - Tennessee Women, Infants, and Children

4/25        - CANS

4/29        - Spring Conference

5/4          - Building Strong Brains

5/15        - Creating Normalcy Through Prudent Parenting

5/16        - CARE (Child-Adult Relationship Enhancement)

5/18        - De-Escalation Strategies Series

5/18        - Tennessee Women, Infants, and Children

5/18        - Caring for the Child with Special Health Care Needs

5/23        - Your Money, Your Goals

5/25        - Teen Driver Safety Webinar

5/30        - Signs of Suicide and Prevention Program

6/1          - Trauma Informed Parenting 101

6/10        - Intro to TBRI for Parents

6/13        - Be the One

6/15        - Tennessee Woman, Infants, and Children

6/15        - 8 Strategies that Help Challenging Behaviors in Children

Click HERE to view all videos!
Click HERE for training credit!

Here Are Just A Few Class
Options Approved for

Trauma Credit:

(Click Each Title For More Info)

- Building Strong Brains

- TBRI

- TBRI Podcast Series

- CORE: Teen

- De-Escalation Techniques

- Positive Parenting

- Violence and Trauma

- Trauma Talk

- Right Time Videos

Why We Do It

the DCS Training

Team!

Toney Horton

Foster Parent Training Officer

DCS Talks Podcaster

Newsletter Editor

I became a foster parent trainer
with DCS because I knew it
would be a service for which I
could be proud. I wake up
every day knowing I am with
an organization that is actively
adding to the good in the world,
even if in small ways.

I am a former Peace Corps.
volunteer and middle school
English teacher, and my
motivation has always come
from helping others and gaining
lifelong experiences for myself.
I am pleased to say I am
continuing that mindset here at
DCS with opportunities like
training foster parents, writing
curriculum, recording podcasts
for DCS Talks, and even writing
this newsletter (Thank you for
reading, p.s.). 

Lastly, when I think of the
positive impact my work, and
all of DCS, has done, I am
reminded of a quote from
Robert Baden-Powell, “Try and
leave this world a little better
than you found it, and when
your time comes, you can be
happy in feeling that you have
not wasted your time but have
done your best.”
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